CHASTANG ENTERPRISES HOUSTON LLC / DBA CHASTANG FORD

BUYBOARD 601-19

End User: PANOLA COUNTY Chastang Rep: JACKIE RUDY

Contact: MELANIE EARLE Phone/fax: 713-678-5056

Phone/email: Date: Thursday, Apnl 15, 2021

Product Description: FORD F350 email: jrudy@chastangford.com

A. {tem Number: 128 A. Base Price:

B. Published Options [Itemize each below]
Code Options Bid Price Code Options Bid Price
DRW |DRW CHASSIS UPGRADE § 299500 | 67X |EXTRA HEAVY SERVICE SUSPENSION 8§ 125 00
996 16 2L VB GAS INCLD 872 |REAR VIEW CAMERA & PREPKIT S 415.00
44G |10 SPEED AUTOMATIC INCLD 96V |XL VALUE PACKAGE S 395.00
X4L }4.30 RATIO LIMITED SLIP AXLE 350 00 CV2 |ENGINEERING CHASSIS LAYOUT S 1,298.00
84CA [84" CA UPGRADE 375 00 DELIVERY TO CARTAGE S 595.00

$
S
QD1 JQUICK DELIVERY OUT OF STOCK 3 1,995.00
90L [POWER EQUIPMENT GRQUP S 86500
512 |SPARE TIRE AND WHEEL S 35000
8
$
S

52B |TRAILER BRAKE CONTROLLER 270.00
62R |TRANS POWER TAKE-OFF PROVIS 280 00
WT2 |BFT WORK TRUCK PACKAGE 1,575.00

Total of B. Published Options:{ $ 11.883.00

C. Unpublished Options [Itemize each below, not to exceed 25%] $= 0.0 %
Options Bid Price Options Bid Price

Total of C. Unpublished Options:| $ -

D. Pre-delivery Inspection:
E. Texas State Inspection:
F. Manufacturer Destination/Delivery: [________]
G. Floor Plan Interest (for in-stock and/or equipped vehicles):
H Lot Insurance (for in-stock and/or equipped vehicles):
L Contract Price Adjustment:
J. Additional Delivery Charge: 0 miles E:
K. Subtotal:
Quantity Ordered 1 K=

M. Trade in: [:
N.  BUYBOARD FEE
S 35.159.00)

PRYEY

0. TOTAL PURCHASE PRICE ? ;)% $  35,159.00




p— -

From: Lisa Maraden <Lisa.Maraden@tasb.org>
Sent: Thursday, April 22, 2021 10:47 AM

To: Melanie Earle

Subject: FW: Quote

Attachments: Buyboard Quote.pdf

Good Morning Melanie,
Information is in compliance with the vendor's BuyBoard contract.
Thanks!

Lisa Maraden
Contract Administrator

TBoard

& Couperstive Purchasing

**Notice to Members submitting quote review requests: Due to the high volume of quote verification requests, you
are asked to please allow 2 business days for processing.**

From: Contract Admin <ContractAdmin@buyboard.com>
Sent: Thursday, April 22, 2021 8:18 AM

To: Lisa Maraden <Lisa.Maraden@tasb.org>

Subject: FW: Quote

From: Melanie Earle <melanie earle@co.panola.tx.us>
Sent: Thursday, April 22, 2021 6:30 AM

To: Contract Admin <ContractAdmin@buyboard.com>
Subject: FW: Quote

i sent this quote in for approval a week ago. Could someone please fet me know if it's in compliance with buyboard?

From: Melanie Earle <melanie. earle@co.panola.tx.us>
Sent: Thursday, April 15, 2021 4:03 PM

To: 'Contract Admin' <ContractAdmin@buyboard.com>
Subject: Quote

Please see attached buyboard quote for the purchase of a Ford F-350 from Chastang buyboard contract #601-19. Please
let me know if quote is in compliance with buyboard

Thanks,

ezutivee e ]
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